S o - >%8<&.@< CC:

SEP 2.3 2013
RFB 2014-402: Road Materials
Recap Sheet
Opening Date: Sept 12, 2013, 2:00 p.m., at Johnson County Purchasing Office
Vendor Vendor Vendor
Vendor Name Vulcan Materials Co. APAC-Texas, Inc Fort Worth Crushed Stone
Address Fort Worth, TX Fort Worth, TX
Pickup/FOB Item#/ Desc Pickup/FOB Itemi#/ Pickup/FOB Item##/
Desc Desc
Hot z".-u (334) 85.00/85.25 85.00/** NO BID
Hot Mix (334) 85.00/85.25 85.00/*# NOBID
Type AC 1.5
EM (340) 75.00/75.33 56.00/** NOBID
HMAC (340) 75.00/75.33 58.00/%* NOBID
 Type D
Riprap, Type R 18.00/18.33 NOBID 11.00 pickup
(non-spec)
Riprap, Type F NOBID NO BID NOBID
Surf Agg, Type 18.00/18.25 NOBID NOBID
A, Grade 4
Surf Agg, Type 8.50/8.75 NO BID NOBID
A, Grade § Not TxDOT grade
Surf Agg, Type 18.00/18.25 NO BID
B, Grade 4 NOBID
Surf Agg, Type 8.50/8.75 NO BID NO BID
B, Grade § Not TxDOT grade
3/8” Pea Gravel NO BID NOBID NOBID
RB Lime Waste NO BID NOBID NO BID
Weather Lime NO BID NO BID NOBID
Sand Concrete 6.50/6.75 NO BID NOBID
MFG sand from
crushed limestone




Port Type I/II NO BID NO BID NOBID
Flex, Grade 1 7.50/7.75 NO BID 4.15 pickup,
Cresson plant
(Item 242 grade
2)
Flex, Grade 2 7.00/7.25 NO BID 5.15 pickup
Weatherford
_plant/no FOB
Flex, Grade 3 NOBID NO BID 5.15 pickup
Weatherford
plant/no FOB
Coat Rock PB3 45.00/45.25 NO BID NOBID
Coat Rock PB4 45.00/45.25 NO BID NO BID
HP Cold Mix NO BID 105.00/%*x* NO BID
Min. Order 23 tons delivered;
No minimum
Other Fees

**¥FOB 1-10
miles $5.00 per ton
+$.25 each
additional mile
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Vendor Vendor Vendor

Vendor Name Arnold Crushed Stone Squaw Creek Materials Ingram Concrete
Address Blum, TX Rainbow, TX Cleburne, TX

Pickup/FOB Item#/ Desc Pickup/FOB Item#/ Pickup/FOB Item#/

Desc Desc

Hot Mix (334) NOBID NO BID NO BID
Type F
Hot Mix (334) NOBID NOBID NOBID
Type AC 1.5
HMAC (340) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type B
HMAC (340) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type D
Riprap, Type R 16.00 pickup ﬁwwﬁwﬂ_% St + o NO BID NO BID

Tolar ~u~gn Przi = ¥i00 plhe
Riprap, Type F | 16.00 pickup {[ver> -si5:0» 4]  NO BID NO BID

Tolar plant /%t 4 - $1z.00 pl4od
Surf Agg, Type NO BID NO BID Y4 torpedo
A, Grade 4 gravel $6.50

pickup/ call re:
FOB rate
Surf Agg, Type NO BID NO BID NOBID
A, Grade 5
Surf Agg, Type NOBID NO BID NOBID
B, Grade 4
Surf Agg, Type NO BID NO BID NOBID
B, Grade 5
3/8” Pea Gravel NO BID NOBID 11.00 pickup if
available/call
re: FOB rate

RB Lime Waste NO BID NO BID NO BID




Weather Lime NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sand Concrete NO BID 5.50/5.75 10.50 pickup/
call re: FOB
rate
Port Type /Il NO BID NO BID NO BID
Flex, Grade 1 NOBID 6.25/6.50 NOBID
S (type A)
Flex, Grade2 | 4.95 Eo_ev\w vor i $h.0s pltm]  6:25/6.50 NO BID
Blum plant ( |eers - $1.50 pibd (type A)
Flex, Grade 3 4.90 pickup ('|peT3-4 %% it  NOBID NO BID
Blum plant ) [Pe7 4% .09 gl
Coat Rock PB3 NO BID NOBID NOBID
Coat Rock PB4 NO BID NO BID NO BID
HP Cold Mix NO BID NO BID NO BID
Min. Order 24 tons
delivered

Other Fees




Vendor Vendor Vendor
Vendor Name Heartland Asphalt Materials Trinity Construction Materials TXI Operations
Address Hurst, TX Kopperl, TX Dallas, TX
Pickup/FOB Item#/ Desc Pickup/FOB Item##/ Pickup/FOB Item#/
Desc Desc
Hot Mix (334) NO BID NOBID
Type F
Hot Mix (334) NO BID NOBID
pe AC 1.5
HMAC (340) NO BID NOBID
Type B
HMAC (340) NO BID NOBID
Type D
Riprap, Type R NO BID NOBID
Riprap, Type F O NO BID NO BID
Surf Agg, Type NO BID NO BID
A, Grade 4
Surf Agg, Type NO BID NOBID
A, Grade §
Surf Agg, Type H NO BID NO BID
B, Grade 4
Surf Agg, Type — NO BID 13.50/28.50 all
B, Grade 5 precincts
3/8” Pea Gravel 6.00 pickup¥ | Item 23 3/8” NOBID
o FB .| peagravel
RB Lime Waste NO BID NO BID
Weather Lime NOBID NOBID
Sand Concrete 9.00 pickup Item 10 NO BID
concrete sand




Port Type I/11 NO BID d(5S- /46| Bulk Bags
bulk bags/ Spread Cement

(65— 550 bRy

Flex, Grade 1 NO BID NOBID

Flex, Grade 2 NO BID 6.25/21.25

Flex, Grade 3 NOBID 6.25/21.25

Coat Rock PB3 NO BID 27.50/42.50

Coat Rock PB4 NOBID NO BID

HP Cold Mix NO BID No BID

Min. Order 24 tons 23 ton min

Other Fees Spread fee for
Portland Cement
$200.00 per load

Attest: Becca Walsh, Buyer; Heather Carmichael, Buyer




